Modassir Hassan

From: Tushar Pithwa <tushar@protojars.in>

Sent: Wednesday, October 12, 2016 5:12 PM

To: Modassir Hassan

Cc: vikas@jiklink.com; saji@jiklink.com; raviiyer@jiklink.com
Subject: Re: Price List for IOCL

Dear Sir

We confirm the order @ rs 101 / kg for 1 ton random 2120 mc
Plus vat & freight
Tushar Pithwa

Techno Enterprise

On 12-Oct-2016 5:08 PM, "Modassir Hassan" <modassir@jiklink.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

As discussed in the meeting kindly confirm the order
For PP RCP 2120 MC

Quantity: 1 Ton

Payment : Within 30 Days of Delivery

Revert if any query

Thanks & Regards,
M Modassir Hassan
Manager (Operations)

Jik Infotech Pvt. Lid.
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